
Let's Pray Together

First Friday
Open Session

Meeting Virtually

VALUE UNCONDITIONAL



Open Session
Agenda

8:30 - Welcome | Open with prayer

8:35 - Cover "Good to Know"

8:40 - Review Prayer Requests 
             & Pray

9:00 - Close with prayer

Questions?  Reach us at  Contact@ValueUnconditional.org



PRAYER STYLES DIFFER

 You may hear people praying
more traditionally or more

charismatically than you are
accustomed to, but while our
prayer styles may differ, we

are unified in our prayers.



Let's be respectful of how
others pray and recognize

others may practice another
Bible-believing denomination

than we practice, and that
may be reflected in differing

approaches to prayer. 



Matthew 18:19,20



BE COMFORTABLE MUTE & PRIVACY

Have your video on

Be dressed up

Pray out loud (audibly)

We will provide the prayer
requests during the virtual

meeting. While welcome, it is
not necessary or expected 

for you to:





We believe God hears your

prayers either way! If you are
comfortable and would like to

do so, you are welcome to.  
We are happy to have you

joining us in prayer regardless.



MUTE - If you are not praying
audibly, please be sure to go
on mute to be respectful of

others on the call.





LINK SHARING - if there is
someone who would like to

join the open session, please
do not share the link! Direct

them to contact Value
Unconditional and we will

send them personal
instructions for joining the

meeting.

Value Unconditional - Open Prayer Session 



TAKE TURNS

If you feel led to pray audibly,
please feel free to begin

praying once another person
has stopped. There will not be
a designated order for those
who attend, so if nobody is

praying audibly, you are more
than welcome to!



Service providers will be

present on the call and may
be encouraged by hearing

your prayers, so if you feel led
and comfortable, we would

love for our team to be lifted
up through you.

Questions?  Reach us at  Contact@ValueUnconditional.org



Rules of Engagement



Thank You For

Praying With Us

WWW.VALUEUNCONDITIONAL.ORG


